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EXECUTIVE SUMMARY 

The COVID-19 pandemic has had several negative effects in terms of industrial production, 
employment, income and public health in Latin America. The current scenario presents an uneven 
trend in terms of economic and employment recovery, with a more pronounced impact on women, 
young people, people with less education and the population in a situation of social vulnerability. 

Forests contribute to economic development and human well-being, and their roles in providing 
income and livelihoods are critical, especially for rural communities, indigenous peoples, small farm 
owners and other forest-dependent communities. Therefore, it is important to assess the impacts of 
COVID-19 on forests and forest dependent people. 

In this context, the UNFF Secretariat hired Dr. Ivan Tomaselli to conduct the sub-regional assessment 
of the challenges faced by the LA countries, the strategies, recovery measures and best practices for 
reducing the impact of COVID-19 pandemic on forests and the forest sector.  

The approach used for this study was based on the collection, compilation and analysis of primary 
and secondary information. As for primary data and information gathering, a questionnaire was 
prepared by the Consultant, which was sent to relevant stakeholders identified. Secondary 
information consisted of a literature review, including published studies and reports, news, policy 
briefs and other relevant publications available. 

Main challenges faced by countries 

Among the main challenges that the pandemic brought to the countries of the LA region, stands out 
that to contain the spread of COVID-19, the main measure adopted was to suspend some economic 
activities, which led to a global economic crisis, with a devastating effect on Latin America, a region 
that already suffers from poverty and social inequality. 

 Impact of COVID-19 in LA Region 

The COVID-19 pandemic affected the region in a devastating manner, it is estimated that 
approximately 47.2 million were infected and 1.6 million of lives were lost to the COVID-19 up to 
December 2021 in LAC region.  

 Overview of main Macroeconomic Impacts 

In 2020, the economic decline generated an estimated drop of 7.1% of GDP in the LAC region. The 
contraction of economic activity also generated a significant increase in the unemployment rate, 
estimated at around 10.5%, a deep drop in participation in the labor market and a considerable 
increase in poverty and inequality. Industrial production presented a strong retraction, mainly in the 
second quarter of 2020. The economic crises also had an impact on prices increase and inflation in 
some countries, mainly in Brazil. The Foreign Direct Investment (FDI) in 2020 was 34.7% less than in 
2019 in LAC region.  

 Impacts on forest sector 

The impacts of the COVID-19 pandemic on the forest sector were less evident when compared to 
other sectors of the economy and happened in a similar way in most LA countries.  With the 
reduction in inspection activities, there was also an increase in non-compliance with legislation, an 
increase in deforestation and forest degradation caused by forest fires. Regarding sustainable forest 
management, the distancing measures and definition of essential activities were decisive on the 
impact of the pandemic in the forest sector. Government of some countries such as Argentina and 
Brazil considered forest production chain as an essential activity, on the other hand, Colombia, 
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Ecuador and Mexico had restrictions on forest production activities. One of the main impacts of the 
COVID-19 pandemic on the industrial sector of forest products and by-products was the increase in 
external demand and exports in some countries, mainly led by the currency depreciation, while in 

. other countries there was a reduction in production and, consequently, in exports

Key measures to mitigate the Covid-19 impacts 

Social isolation was one of the main measures adopted by federal and state governments in the LA 
region to prevent the dissemination of COVID-19. However, each country and each state handled this 
measure differently. The establishment of essential services that could work during the emergency 
period was also one of the most used strategies among LAC governments to maintain the economy 
and try to control the COVID-19 dissemination. Between the health measures, governments of the 
region had to increase the capacity of their health care systems to deal with the crisis, together with 
facilitating access for all populations. Additionally, vaccination efforts are the result of some 
measures adopted by countries such as national immunization plans and agreements with 
laboratories in the vaccine manufacturing for the population. Among the economic measures, credit 
lines for small and medium-sized companies, reductions in prices and taxes for health and hygiene 
products, debt renegotiation, as well as direct payment assistance to low-income people are 
highlighted. Special funds for economic recovery and assistance to people in vulnerable situations 
were also created. Some programs were also created to maintain the existing jobs or create new 
ones. 

Impacts of the measures adopted and recovery 

An economic recovery of LA countries is expected for the next years. LA countries should have a 
growth of 5.2% in 2021, considering the advance of the vaccination schedule in most countries, the 
relaxation of mobility restrictions, the positive effects of advanced economies and the rise in 
commodity prices. It is important to highlight that, in addition to the prospect of economic recovery, 
there is a drastic reduction in the number of cases and deaths from COVID-19, reflecting the advance 
of vaccination in most countries. This is a key point for the population to resume their activities at a 
pre-pandemic level. Regarding forest sector specifically, a few government measures were taken to 
reduce the impact of the COVID-19 pandemic. In terms of economic recovery, the outlook for the 
forest sector is generally optimistic, partly because of the resumption of civil construction in the US, 
the main destination market for solid wood products of LA countries. Production and export levels 
have returned, or will most possibly return to pre-pandemic levels, for most countries of the region 
along the next few months in 2022. Considering the advance of vaccination, tourism and ecotourism 
will also present a recovery with the reopening of borders and resumption of activities in tourist 
spots. 

Best practices identified 

Among the health measures, highlights include the mandatory use of masks, in addition to hand 
hygiene, increased capacity for beds to care for more patients, and measures for the production and 
application of vaccines in the population. Among the economic measures, emergency credit lines 
stand out, especially for Small and Medium-sized companies in the production sector and rural 
producers as well as emergency aid to the population. Regarding social measures, most countries of 
the region created programs to ensure the maintenance of employment and income, which were 
essential to reduce the impact of COVID-19 on people's lives. Specifically for the forest sector, in 
most countries, forestry was considered as an essential activity, which to some extent reduced the 
impact of the pandemic on the sector. 
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1 – INTRODUCTION 

1.1 – BACKGROUND 

The COVID-19 pandemic brought a global crisis, which caused a change in the levels of production 
and consumption of several products, aggravated the levels of inequality in emerging countries, in 
addition to worsening existing environmental problems, such as deforestation and forest fires. 
COVID-19 brought impacts to society, reaching countless communities, including those farther away, 
affecting forests and forestry several ways. 

Due to the broad range of vital services that forests provide for economic functioning and human 
wellbeing, as well as their roles in providing income, livelihoods, and well-being of people, especially 
rural communities, indigenous peoples, small farms holders, and other forest-dependent 
communities, it is important to assess the impacts of COVID-19 on forests and forest-dependent 
people.  

In light of the above, the Unites Nations Forum on Forest (UNFF) Secretariat plans to conduct a global 
assessment of the challenges faced by countries, and the strategies, recovery measures and best 
practices implemented for reducing the impact of COVID-19 on forests and forest sector, through 
commissioning several regional assessments in each of the following five UN regions, namely, Africa, 
Asia-Pacific, Eastern Europe, Latin America and Caribbean, and Western Europe and Other Groups.  

The results of the assessments will be discussed at a virtual UNFF global Expert Group Meeting 
(EGM), with participation of experts from Members of the Forum, Collaborative Partnership on 
Forests (CPF) member organizations, regional partners and major group representatives in January 
2022. The key findings of these assessments and the outcome of expert group meeting will be 
incorporated in the official documents for consideration of UNFF17. 

In this context, the UNFF Secretariat hired Dr. Ivan Tomaselli to conduct the sub-regional assessment 
of the challenges faced by countries, and the strategies, recovery measures and best practices for 
reducing the impact of COVID-19 pandemic on forests and the forest sector for Latin America sub-
region. Also, the Consultant will produce a regional assessment report on the findings of the 
assessments of the Latin America and Caribbean region in collaboration with the consultant for the 
Caribbean sub-region. 

This document is the Final Assessment Report, comprising the main findings of the assessment. The 
report begins with an analysis of the challenges facing countries in relation to the macroeconomic 
impacts of the pandemic, as well as impacts on forests and the forest sector. Next, the measures 
adopted by countries to mitigate the impact of COVID-19 on the economy and society are presented. 
Then, the possible impacts of the measures adopted on economic recovery and the forestry sector 
are shown, followed by an overview of the best practices adopted. Finally, the consultant analyzes 
the future of the sector after the COVID-19 pandemic. 
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1.2 – OBJECTIVES 

In view of the above, and based on the Terms of Reference, the main objectives of the work are: 

 To conduct the sub-regional assessment of the challenges faced by countries, and the 
strategies, recovery measures and best practices for reducing the impact of COVID-19 
pandemic on forests and the forest sector for Latin America (LA) sub-region; and 

 To produce a regional assessment report on the findings of the assessments of the Latin 
America and Caribbean region in collaboration with the consultant for the Caribbean sub-
region. 

1.3 – METHODOLOGY AND SOURCES OF INFORMATION 

1.3.1 Geographic Coverage 

The study covers the Latin America sub-region and partly the Caribbean sub-region since the 
recommendations as result of the assessment carried out for the Caribbean sub-region (prepared by 
other Consultant) will be consolidated in the final regional assessment. 

The analysis in the LA sub-region is focused mainly on the countries with the highest concentration of 
forest production (e.g., Argentina, Bolivia, Brazil, Peru, Chile, Uruguay, other relevant countries). 

1.3.2 Sources of Information  

The information used in this product is from primary and secondary sources: 

i) Primary: 

Primary information includes contacts of UNFF Regional Focal Points provided by UNFF in order to 
obtain general information about COVID-19 in the forestry sector. Additionally, the consultant made 
contacts with main relevant stakeholders via application of a questionnaire to obtain targeted 
information 

ii) Secondary:  

It consisted of literature review, including published studies and reports, news, policy briefs and 
other relevant publications available. 

1.3.3 Approach used to carry out the study 

The approach used for this product was based on the collection, compilation and analysis of 
information. As for primary data and information gathering, a questionnaire was prepared by the 
Consultant, which was sent to relevant stakeholders identified. Until now, few responses were 
received. This version of the report is based on secondary information / literature and questionnaire 
responses. 

As for literature review, it is noteworthy that not all countries analyzed have the same database. 
Therefore, the contents of information differ among the countries because each country provides 
information varying in the level of detail. Moreover, the period of analysis varied according to the 
data availability.  
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2 – CHALLENGES FACED BY COUNTRIES 

The COVID-19 pandemic has brought several challenges related to public health, economy and 
market, industrial production, labor market and others. Therefore, people had to adapt to this new 
reality, working from home and changing their consumption patterns. Governments also had to take 
measures to contain the spread of the virus, reduce the impact of the pandemic on the economy, 
protect society from unemployment, hunger and misery. 

This section describes the main challenges related to macroeconomic impacts and challenges on the 
forest sector faced by selected LA countries. 

2.1 – Impact of COVID-19 in LA Region 

The COVID-19 pandemic affected the region in a devastating manner. It is estimated more than 47.2 
million infections and that 1.6 million of lives were lost to the COVID-19 up to November 2021 in LAC 
region. For a few months, Latin America was the epicenter of the pandemic, a scenario that has been 
improving with the advance of vaccination in many countries. The table below shows an overview of 
the pandemic in some countries in Latin America. 

 

Table 1 – Cumulative confirmed COVID-19 cases and deaths in selected countries 

Country 
Cumulative Confirmed 

deaths (Dec/21) 

Cumulative Confirmed 
cases (Dec/21) (in 

Million) 

Argentina 116,771 5.36 

Brazil 614,457 22.18 

Chile  38,716 1,78 

Colombia 129.163 5,10 

Peru 201,770 2,25 

Uruguay 6,145 0,41 
Source: Our World in Data (2021). 

There was an increase in poverty, unemployment, inflation, reduction of foreign investments and 
industrial production. All sectors were affected, with a major impact on unemployment, especially 
related to young people with less formal education, as well as women and socially vulnerable people. 

The interruption of selected economic activity as a result of the social distancing measures applied by 
countries to mitigate or reduce the COVID-19 contagion curve and, in parallel, make health systems 
sustainable, had an effect on economic performance from all countries in the region. 

2.2 – An Overview of Macroeconomic Impacts 

The main macroeconomic impacts in Latin America during the pandemic period were examined. Latin 
America and the Caribbean will grow in 2021, although the pandemic remains present and the crisis 
has aggravated longstanding structural problems in the region: low investment and productivity, 
informality, unemployment, inequality and poverty. Therefore, recovering investment and 
employment, especially in environmentally sustainable sectors, is key to a transformative and 
inclusive recovery (ECLAC, 2021). 

The health and economic crisis caused by the COVID-19 pandemic sustained an estimate of the 
largest GDP contraction worldwide since 1946, as a result of a generalized drop in economic activity. 
In the LA region, the crisis triggered a considerable contraction in international trade, strong 
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fluctuations in commodity prices and high volatility in financial markets. If different health, 
economic, social and inequality indicators are considered, it is likely that LAC is the region most hit by 
the pandemic among emerging countries, according to CEPAL (2020a). 

Between the 2014-2019 period, the region already had a low economic growth, on average 0.3% and 
specifically in 2019 the growth rate was 0.1%. In 2020, the economic depression together with the 
need to implement measures of confinement, physical distance and closure of production activities, 
generated an estimated drop of 7.1% of GDP in the LAC region (ECLAC, 2021). 

The regional growth projection for 2021 is 5.9% and warned that the region will experience a 
deceleration in 2022, with an estimated expansion of 2.9%. Growth in 2021 is mainly attributable to 
the low basis of comparison, after the contraction recorded in 2020, along with the positive effects 
arising from external demand and the rise in the price of commodities that the region exports, as 
well as to increases in aggregate demand (CEPAL, 2021d). 

The contraction of economic activity also generated a significant increase in the unemployment rate, 
estimated at around 10.5%, a deep drop in participation in the labor market and a considerable 
increase in poverty and inequality (ECLAC, 2021).  

Table 2 presents the GDP along the last three years, as reported by the World Bank. The data shows 
that the GDP in 2020 dropped drastically in all countries, particularly Argentina and Peru. 

 

Table 2 – Comparative GDP of selected countries 

Country 
GDP Annual Growth Rate (%) 

2018 2019 2020 

Argentina -2.6 -2.1 -9.9 

Brazil 1.8 1.4 -4.1 

Chile  3.7 0.9 -5.8 

Colombia 2.6 3.3 -6.8 

Peru 4.0 2.2 -11.1 

Uruguay 0.5 0.4 -5.9 
Source: World Bank (2021). 

The COVID-19 pandemic also had an impact on price hikes and inflation in some countries. In Brazil, 
the Extended Consumer Price Index (IPCA) closed 2020 at 4.52%, the highest since 2016 (6.29%). This 
increase was mainly affected by the prices of soy oil (103.79%), rice (76.01%), housing (5.25%), 
electricity (9.14%), meat (17.97%) and others (IBGE, 2021). Information on the consumer price index 
of selected countries of the region is presented in Table 3. 

 

Table 3 – Consumer Price Index of selected countries 

Country 
Consumer Price Index (%) 

2019 2020 

Argentina 53.8 36.1 

Brazil 4.31 4.52 

Chile  3 3 

Peru 2.14 1.83 

Uruguay 7.88 9.76 
Sources: DATOSMACRO, STATISTA, IBGE (2021). 
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In 2020, LAC received 105.48 billion of Foreign Direct Investment (FDI), 34.7% less than in 2019. The 
natural resources and manufacturing sectors, with reductions of -47 % and -38%, respectively, were 
the most affected in 2020 (CEPAL, 2021). 

In Bolivia, as in other countries worldwide, the impact of COVID-19 has been devastating for the 
national economy. During 2020 Bolivian economy decreased 12 points. Some regulations of the 
transitional government prevented basic services, including electricity, from increasing its price and 
suspension in the obligation to pay monthly consumption bills has been established. On the other 
hand, the inflation is under control (Bolivia Questionnaire, 2021). 

In the case of Chile, its economy is going through one of the biggest economic crises in its history, 
with a 6% drop in GDP in 2020; the loss of more than a million jobs; and an increase in absolute 
poverty that, according to ECLAC forecasts, would be close to 4%. At the level of economic sectors, 
the most affected continue to be services, mainly those intensive in personal contact, tourism and 
domestic work, as well as other sectors such as civil construction and commerce. Inflation in Chile 
has been over 3% per year in recent months (3.6% in May/2021), and it remains within the tolerance 
range of the Central Bank. In terms of electricity price, it has shown an upward trend since the end of 
last year due to the rebound in petrol prices at the international level (Chile Questionnaire, 2021). 

Furthermore, industrial production presented a strong retraction, mainly in the second quarter of 
2020. In LAC this retraction was -24.2% in Apr-Jun/20 compared to the same quarter of the previous 
year, and -21.4% compared to the 1st quarter/20. This result was mainly due to the results of 
industries in Brazil (-22.1%), Argentina (-22.6%) and Mexico (-29.8%) (IEDI, 2020). 

All LA countries were severely affected by the economic crisis caused by the COVID-19 pandemic in 
2020. It is still early to quantify a long lasting impact, but with the progress of vaccination 
/immunizations and the resumption of economic activity, these indicators may be much more 
optimistic from 2021 onwards. 

2.3 – Impacts on the Forest Sector 

The impacts of the COVID-19 pandemic on the forest sector were less evident when compared to 
other sectors of the economy. For some countries such as Brazil, production and exports of products 
related to the pulp and paper chain increased between 2019 and 2020. The management of natural 
forests had its role reduced in some countries. These preliminary results will be detailed in the 
following items. 

a. Forests and Sustainable Forest Management 

The pandemic brought immediate challenges to the forest sector. One of them, by being recognized 
as an essential sector, led companies to have to deal with new health and safety conditions, changing 
production and market dynamics and, in some jurisdictions, reducing the availability of workers. 

Forests and sustainable forest management can be considered essential mechanisms to reduce 
poverty, as they are important sources of income in countries with vast areas of tropical forests in 
Latin America. Despite its resilience, the forest sector has faced and faces challenges since the 
beginning of the COVID-19 pandemic. 

The first concern was the loss of primary tropical forests due to deforestation and forest degradation 
in 2020. Brazil was the country that lost the most primary forests in 2020, with a 25% greater loss 
compared to 2019, an area equivalent to approximately 1.7 million hectares (WRI, 2021). 

Other LA countries also had a considerable loss from deforestation, with emphasis on Bolivia, Peru, 
Colombia and Mexico. Information of deforestation of selected countries of the region is presented 
in Table 4. 

https://www.linguee.com.br/ingles-portugues/traducao/furthermore.html
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Table 4 – Deforested area in 2020 in selected countries 

Country 
Deforested area in 2020 

(1000ha) 

Brazil 1,700 

Bolivia 250 

Peru 170 

Colombia 165 

Mexico 80 
Source: WRI (2021). 

In the case of Brazil, specifically in the Amazon, in addition to deforestation, a major cause of forest 
degradation was the increase of forest fire outbreaks. In 2019, most fires were identified in already 
deforested areas, unlike 2020, where a vast extension of forests suffered from fires, which spread 
due to dry weather and below normal rainfall (WRI, 2021). In addition to destroying vast areas rich in 
biodiversity, fires also pose a serious risk of economic loss by destroying areas of managed natural 
forest or plantation forests. 

Forest fires also pose serious risks to people's health and lives, as they trigger the onset of chronic 
respiratory diseases, which usually affect mainly children and elderly people, the latter being a risk 
group for COVID-19. With hospitals full of COVID-19 patients, the risk of respiratory diseases caused 
by smoke from fires overload on public health, especially in areas with greater social vulnerability, 
usually small towns located in rural areas, areas with greater concentration of forestry activities. 

The impact of the pandemic on forest management and related activities happened in a similar way 
in most LA countries. The distancing measures and definition of essential activities (which could or 
could not operate during 2020 and 2021) were decisive on the impact of the pandemic in the sector. 
In Argentina, for example, the national government, through Administrative Decision 450/2020, 
expanded the list of activities and services declared essential in emergency situations and included 
activities related to the production, distribution and commercialization of forest products, allowing 
these activities to keep working. 

In Brazil, State and Municipal Governments determined the essential activities that could work 
during the pandemic period. Thus, the impact of the pandemic on the forest sector may have been 
different in each state. A court decision was identified that affected some states in the legal Amazon 
(Pará, Rondônia, Amazonas and Mato Grosso). In these states, any movement of wood registered the 
Brazilian National System for the Control of the Origin of Forest Products (SINAFLOR) was limited, as 
well as obtaining the Document of Forest Origin (DOF). This decision was in force between May and 
June 2020, and affected the production chain of the tropical timber sectors (PORTAL AMAZONIA, 
2020). 

Also in Brazil, the production of pulp and paper, since the beginning of the pandemic, was considered 
an essential activity, which was allowed to operate normally during the emergency period, thus, the 
planted forests sector was less affected. Similarly, the governments of Chile and Uruguay also 
included forestry production activities as essential services, being able to operate during the 
emergency period, in some cases with restrictions (TOMASELLI, 2021). 

In the case of Paraguay, sustainable forest management was less affected, taking into account that 
activities along the silvicultural chain did not come to a full stop. However, primary industrial activity 
had some limitations. IFSA Paraguay said that the forest sector in the country is going through a good 
moment with the perspectives of post-pandemic recovery. Sustainable forest management is a 
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frequent challenge in Paraguay, which is why the impacts generated by the pandemic have 
aggravated the sector's challenges (IFSA Paraguay questionnaire). 

Other countries had restrictions on forestry activities, such as Colombia, Ecuador and Mexico. In 
Mexico, the forestry sector was not considered an essential activity and was paralyzed for several 
months due to the pandemic. This led to a reduction in production, especially at the community 
level, where many people temporarily lost their jobs or had their wages reduced (TOMASELLI, 2021). 

In Chile, the health crisis has slowed down the functioning of the various areas of society and has 
required the adaptation of a new work scheme in the midst of the crisis. Among the positive aspects, 
new opportunities emerged such as the design and implementation of how forest restoration will 
contribute to a green or sustainable reactivation of the country, generating new sources of 
employment and a valuation of the ecosystem services that will be generated by the areas to be 
restored. Additionally, sustainable forest management and nature-based solutions have the potential 
to contribute to green economies, from a landscape-scale restoration approach (Chile Questionnaire, 
2021). 

In Ecuador, forest management whose objective is timber processing for export, was less affected, 
since the forest producers continued with activities of harvesting, mobilizing and timber processing, 
different from companies whose processing is aimed at the domestic market, these were affected 
between the months of March-August 2020 (DADS Ecuador questionnaire). 

In Peru, containment measures directly affected sustainable forest management, considering that 
the suspension of activities during containment period, when the season in which logging is allowed 
in Annual Cut plot (Parcelas de Corta Annual - PCA), known as “zafra”, has stopped for several 
months. Originally, it was scheduled between May and November. In addition, the forest concession 
areas were affected by the suspension of forest management activities (LA REPÚBLICA, 2021a). Also 
in Peru, another challenge stressed was transport logistics, due to the lack of availability of 
containers. As a result, ship owners are entering the land-based logistics business. Due to the initial 
quarantines, many forest engineers went back to their home regions, thus there was a reduction in 
the number of skilled workers. By the end of 2021, this scenario has somewhat been regularized, 
with annual certification audits being resumed in the country (ADEX Peru questionnaire). 

In addition, some environmental agencies had their operation suspended or restricted service, which 
was the case in Brazil and Colombia. As a result, administrative deadlines for environmental agencies 
were suspended, as well as possible delays in issuing environmental licenses, management plans and 

by environmental agencies, there was monitoring in general. With this limitation of functioning 
possibly a failure in inspection, which may have resulted in an increase in illegal logging in tropical 
forests in LAC, in addition to an increase in forest fires (WRI, 2021). 

b. Livelihoods of Forest Dependent People 

The pandemic also brought several challenges for people who depend on the forest and may have 
critically affected the forest and agricultural production, involving mainly small farmers and family 
extractors. According to a survey carried out (IDB, 2021a), the main problems found were: the 
difficulty of obtaining inputs, access to labor and production flow problems, in addition to mobility 
restrictions. 

In addition, the COVID-19 pandemic has had a devastating effect on many indigenous and tribal 
territories in the region. Not only has it infected thousands of dwellers, also many forest 
communities have lost markets for their forest products and tourism services, and government 
efforts to prevent invasions, forest fires and illegal logging in these territories have weakened. In the 
current pandemic context, these invasions not only threaten the forests, but also endanger the lives 
of the inhabitants (FAO, 2021). 
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Indigenous peoples are more vulnerable to epidemics due to worse social, economic and health 
conditions than non-indigenous peoples, which increase the potential for the spread of diseases. 
Particular conditions affect these populations, such as the difficulty in accessing health services, 
whether due to geographic distance or the unavailability or insufficiency of health teams (ISA, 2021). 

Furthermore, a challenging point is that the livelihoods of many peoples create an exposure to 
infectious diseases that people in cities are not exposed to, as most indigenous peoples live in 
collective houses and, it is common among many of them to share utensils, such as gourds, bowls 
and other objects, which favors contagion situations (ISA, 2021). 

From January 2020 to August 20, 2021, based on information available, around 600 thousand 
cumulative confirmed cases of COVID-19, including 15 thousand deaths, were reported in indigenous 
peoples or communities of 18 countries in the region (PAHO/WHO, 2021). 

Among the focus countries of this study, the highest number of cases and deaths recorded are in 
Colombia (68,716), Chile (66,716) and Brazil (52,425) (PAHO/WHO 2021). Table 5 presents a 
summary of the registry of confirmed cases and deaths registered among indigenous people in some 
LA countries. 

 

Table 5 - Number of confirmed cases and deaths from COVID-19 among indigenous people (by August/2021) 

Country Number of confirmed 
cases of COVID-19 

Number of deaths 
by COVID-19 

Argentina 2,993 100 

Bolivia 28,764 556 

Brazil 52,425 785 

Chile 66,724 1.193 

Colombia 68,716 1.975 

Costa Rica 2,321 34 

Ecuador 5,832 216 

Mexico 21,046 3.253 

Paraguay 482 56 

Peru 30,720 670 

Source: PAHO / WHO (2021). 

 

c. Forest Industries and Demand for Forest Products and Services 

The challenges faced by the forest-industrial sector caused by global health crisis had different 
impacts when it comes to natural or plantation forests. Although LAC's share in the global wood 
market has increased significantly over the last years, this growth was closely linked to the expansion 
of planted forests located mainly in Brazil, Chile and Uruguay.  

One of the main impacts of the COVID-19 pandemic on the industrial sector of forest products and 
by-products was the increase in external demand and exports in some countries, while in others 
there was a reduction in production and, consequently, in exports. 

In Argentina, the forest sector represented 1.1% of total country’s exports in 2020. Its exports 
reached 606 million dollars and decreased 12.3% compared to the same period of the previous year. 
Almost half of the forest sector exports of the country (48%) corresponded to pulp and paper 
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products (mainly chemical pulp of coniferous wood, paper and cardboard) and the timber sector 
(pine sawnwood, profiled coniferous wood and log) contributed with 32% (INDEC, 2020).  

In Bolivia, there are two phases in relation to the COVID-19 pandemic. The first phase is in 2020 
when the pandemic outbreak coincided with a transitional government that was wise not to paralyze 
the production of goods and some services, without risking the population. This is the case of the 
forestry industry, which, throughout 2020, was authorized to work in the primary industry 
production and exports of stocks were allowed. Trade has been the most affected activity by COVID-
19, followed by the secondary and tertiary industry. In the post-confinement phase of COVID-19, 
segments of secondary transformation were the most affected, such as production of plywood and 
veneers. These segments face other problems, including: a) illiquidity; and b) imports, especially the 
particleboard industry. Currently, exports are also significantly affected due to problems in 
international logistics, such as the lack of transport and containers (Bolivia Questionnaire, 2021). 

For Brazil, the increase in exports stood out, this was probably driven by the depreciation of Brazilian 
currency (Real) and higher demand of forest products in the domestic market from other countries, 
such as the United States, China and Vietnam.  Information on the country exports of selected forest 
products, pre and over the pandemic period, are presented in Table 6. 

 

Table 6 – Exports of Brazilian of Selected forest Products 

     Product 2019 2020 Var.(2019-
2020) 

Projection 
2021 

Var.  
(2020-2021) 

Tropical Plywood                     89 102 15% 120 19% 

Tropical Sawnwood              532 450 -15% 460 2% 

Pine Plywood                          2,06 2,46 19% 2,55 4% 

Pine Sawnwood                     2,46 3,03 23% 3,2 6% 

 Source: Tomaselli (2021) 

In Chile, timber forest exports totaled almost USD 4.9 billion in 2020, which indicated a 12.6% 
decrease compared to the previous year, when USD 5,6 billion were exported, constituting the 
lowest result in the last five years (CORMA, 2021). Despite this decline in 2020, Chile's forest sector 
has shown a recovery. In July and August, exports of forest products registered the highest values of 
the year, with USD 590 million in July and USD 577 million in August, an increase over 30% in relation 
to its peers last year. With these numbers, the accumulated in the first eight months of the year 
registers an amount of around USD 3.8 billion, a 15.3% growth in relation to the same period of last 
year (INFOR, 2021). 

Additionally in Chile, movement restrictions have impacted the transport of forest products from 
production sites to market centers, affecting the income of both, producers and sellers. The wood 
value chains were seriously affected by the COVID-19 pandemic, but the intensity of the impact were 
not homogeneous. The pulp and paper sector reported a positive impact, as it supplies products 
classified as essential, such as sanitary and hygiene products, and paper and cardboard for product 
packaging, in order to support the increase in trade demand electronic and delivery services since the 
lockdowns began (Chile Questionnaire, 2021). 

In Ecuador, there was a stoppage in the timber supply between March and July 2020. The time when 
forest management plans were not implemented during this period was covered in the forest use 
licenses. Currently, according to the records of Ministry of Environment, Water and Ecological 
Transition (MAATE), there has been an increase in the use of the “balsa” (timber mainly used to 
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manufacture wind power turbine blades and boats) at national level, as a result of the high 
commercial value of the supply and demand that the national and international market has 
generated. The use of this species requires permits from the competent authorities that are granted 
according to the forest laws and regulations in force (DADS Ecuador questionnaire). 

In the case of Peru, the export of wood products in 2020 totaled USD 94 million, the lowest figure in 
the last decade and that indicates a contraction of -24.7% compared to the previous year. In 2020, 
jobs related to wood exports totaled around 22 thousand, a negative variation of -23% compared to 
the previous year (LA REPÚBLICA, 2021). In 2020, Peruvian exports of wood frame totaled US$ 13.6 
million, a 6.3% growth compared to the previous year; and the exports of decking (floorings and 
tables for outdoors) is highlighted with an amount of US$ 13.0 million and a 5.3% growth compared 
to the previous year (ADEX Peru questionnaire). 

Timber Industries (FEDEMADERAS) monitored the In Colombia, the National Federation of 
performance of the forestry sector in Colombia to strengthen sectoral information. A summary of the 
information based on the survey involving responses from 73 forest-related companies1 
(FEDEMADERAS, 2021), is presented below: 

 Performance and sales decline: 45 forest companies (62% of all companies interviewed) 
report that the COVID-19 pandemic have limited their operations during the first half of 
2021. A total of 27 companies did not identify a drop in sales of forest products during 2021, 
compared to 2020. Out of 35 companies that identified a decrease in sales, 11 companies 
reported a decrease between 11% to 30% and 13 companies between 31% and 50%. It is 
concerned that 10% (7 companies) showed a decrease in sales by a percentage greater than 
50%;  

 Variation/change in demand:  more than half (55%) of companies reflects positive results; 22 
companies showed that their demand was maintained and 18 that increased, while 25 
companies indicated a decrease in demand;  

 Price variation: most of the companies (34) kept their prices constant, and 27 companies 
increased the prices of the products;  

 Loss of competitiveness: the survey result shows a perception of the forest sector that 35 
companies stated a loss of competitiveness, but 38 companies said the opposite; 

 Expectation of economic performance: the responses reflect an optimistic view of the sector 
as 92% of the companies reported that the performance can be stable or positive 

 Payroll variation: the behavior of the payroll reflected positive results for the forest sector, 
since 70% of the companies indicated that their payroll in the first half of 2021 was 
maintained or increased compared to the previous year, while 18 companies state that their 
payroll decreased, and require support and incentives for the sector. The companies state 
that the payroll decreased in 2021 as a result of Covid-19 (blockades and closures), with a 
significant impact on the demand of the wood market and the loss of potential customers 
due to access and mobility restrictions. A significant reduction in sales, production and 
operations was faced. For all this, there were cuts in personnel, suspension of contracts and 
the organizational structure itself of companies had to be streamlined. 

                                                           

1 Companies include those that deal with: Forest plantations, forest plantation harvesting, 

commercialization/trade, primary and secondary processing mills, services, natural forest harvesting. 
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In Peru, the influence of the tourism and ecotourism sector on the country's economy stands out, 
this was mostly affected by the containment measures to combat COVID-19 pandemic. The 
pandemic has devastated the Peruvian tourism sector. From receiving 4.4 million foreign tourists and 
entering USD 4.7 billion in foreign exchange in 2019, it has gone on to receive 850 thousand between 
January and October 2020, a fall of 77% almost uniform across all source markets (IDB, 2021b). 

In Uruguay, exports from the forestry (wood, timber products, pulp, paper and cardboard) reached 
USD 1.5 billion in 2020, which represents 18% of the country's total exported goods. In 2020, foreign 
sales of pulp alone totaled USD 1.1 billion, 28% lower than in 2019.  In 2020 Uruguay's exports by-
products reached USD 347 million, representing a 3% drop compared to 2019. On the other hand, 
other products such as sawnwood (7%) and wood-based panels (21%) showed an increase in their 
exported amounts, with the United States being the main destination for these products (GOBIERNO 
DE URUGUAY, 2021). 

In Paraguay, sanitary restrictions were the main challenges for the forest industries. Considering 
production and demand for products and services, the sector recorded relatively low losses 
compared to other segments. The exports of Paraguayan forest products, for example, showed a 
significant increase. Paraguay's timber sector has an average of US$ 100 million in shipments per 
year, however, it is estimated that in 2021 these exports will increase by around 70% (IFSA 
questionnaire).  

The Covid-19 pandemic also caused disruption in the logistics of international trade. As a measure to 
prevent COVID-19, shipping companies began to adopt measures to mitigate losses due to the drop 
in demand, such as the cancellation of scale and transport services. On the other hand, the recovery 
of the economy in some countries led to an increase in orders for inputs and goods in foreign trade 
at levels above projections and the logistical capacity of ship owners and port terminals. This 
scenario had some effects on the international trade of products, such as jamming in ports, lack of 
containers, excessive high freight values and products accumulated in warehouses and ports (CNI, 
2021). 

d. Labor Market and Employment 

According to the Economic Commission for Latin America and the Caribbean (CEPAL) and the 
International Labor Organization (OIT), in 2020, the pandemic triggered the biggest crisis experienced 
in the labor markets of LAC since 1950. Worldwide, the labor markets of the region were the most 
affected by the crisis generated by COVID-19, the number of employed fell 9.0% in 2020, and a 
recovery is expected along 2021 (ECLAC, 2021a). 

In Chile, quarantines and the prohibition to operate for commercial activities where the population is 
concentrated (e.g. restaurants) inevitably have a damaging effect on employment. Some of the 
economic activities can be done remotely, but many activities can only be carried out in person, 
especially those in the manufacturing sector, construction or transport. In those activities, 
employment was reduced of the longer quarantines. Some companies in the forest sector had 
difficulty managing the economic pressure caused by the pandemic and stopped hiring of personnel 
as a strategy. According to a study carried out by the Santiago Chamber of Commerce, in Latin 
America and the Caribbean, and including all productive sectors, Peru, Costa Rica and Chile were 
among the countries where unemployment rates increased the most between March and July 2020. 
Furthermore, despite the forestry sector's potential to promote growth and employment, work 
deficits have been worsened by the pandemic (Chile Questionnaire, 2021). 

The International Labor Organization estimates that in 2020 approximately 39 million people in Latin 
America lost their jobs. The COVID-19 pandemic affects mainly low-skilled workers and also 
exacerbates high inequality of the region (IDB, 2021c). Colombia was the country presenting the 
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highest unemployment rate in 2020 (16.1%), followed by Peru (13.9%) and Brazil (13.5), according to 
S&P Global Ratings (2021),  as shown in Table 7. 

 

Table 7 - Unemployment Rate of LA Selected Countries 

Country 
Unemployment rate (%) 

2019 2020 

Argentina 9.8 11.9 

Brazil 11.9 13.5 

Chile 7.2 10.0 

Colombia 10.5 16.1 

Mexico 3.5 4.5 

Peru 6.6 13.9 
Source: S&P Global Ratings (2021). 

The contraction in employment in 2020 was much deeper in sectors such as hotels (19.2%), 
construction (11.7%), commerce (10.8%) and transport (9.2%), which together concentrate close to 
40% of employment in LAC. In turn, industry (8.6%) and other services (7.5%) also registered 
contractions; while in agriculture the loss of jobs was comparatively lower (2.4%) (CEPAL, 2021b).  

Many workers, mainly informal, could not continue with their work and had to exit the market, which 
prevented them from generating income for their homes and acting in a counter-cyclical manner as 
in previous crises. Likewise, the closure of care services and schools implied a heavy workload within 
homes, which in general is distributed overloading unevenly, especially to women (CEPAL, 2021b). 

e. Forest Financing and Investments 

Latin America has possibly been the region of the world most affected economically by the 
pandemic. The region was already in a phase of slow growth before the pandemic, especially if we 
consider its status as an emerging middle-income region. As expected, the impact of the COVID-19 
crisis led to a sharp drop in internationalization processes, with an estimated reduction of 80% in 
Foreign Direct Investment in 2020 compared to the previous year.  

This drop was mainly associated with postponed investments of large companies’ expansion 
programs, waiting for the uncertainties to dissipate. In addition, also during the pandemic, there 
were important investment operations abroad and some companies expanded internationally. This 
scenario may have been a little different in the forest sector. As demand for pulp and paper 
increased during the COVID-19 crisis period and most companies of this segment continued their 
expansion and investment plans. Chilean Arauco, which bought two factories in Mexico for USD 160 
million, and Chilean company CMPC, which acquired the Brazilian SEPAC for USD 329 million 
(GLOBAL LATAM, 2020). 

In Brazil, it is estimated that up to around USD 10 billion will be invested by 2024 in the country's 
forest-based industry, mainly from companies that use timber from forest plantations as raw 
material. These investments are concentrated in the states of Santa Catarina and Paraná, with the 
expansion of wood-based panel (Berneck) and paper / pulp plant (Klabin and WestRock), in Mato 
Grosso with the installation of Euca Energy pulp mill, expansion of the plant of Bracell in São Paulo, 
installation of a new Suzano factory in Espírito Santo and, finally, construction of a factory for the 
production of dissolving pulp in Minas Gerais (FOLHA, 2021). 

In addition to investments in the forest-based industry, there is an increase in investments in green 
bonds in some LA countries. This type of investment is characterized by the issuance of debt 
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securities to finance projects that generate environmental benefits or mitigate the impact of climate 
change (SWISS INFO, 2021). 

This type of investment had a significant increase in 2020 and 2021, which was leveraged by the 
climate crisis, aggravated by the COVID-19 pandemic. According to the Inter-American Development 
Bank (IDB) estimate, green bonds reached an amount of US$12.5 billion in 2020 and US$ 8.0 billion in 
2021 in LAC. The region represents only 2% of the global green bond market, with Brazil, Chile and 
Mexico responsible for 85% of these investments (SWISS INFO, 2021). 

In Paraguay, forestry financing and investments are always a challenge to the forest sector, but 
during the pandemic, the main challenge has been to obtain financing for the conservation or 
restoration of degraded areas (IFSA questionnaire). 

f. Institutional Capacity 

The pandemic resulted in the reduction of institutional capacity of countries of the LA region, mainly 
in the public sector. 

In Brazil, for example, there was a reduction in IBAMA'S inspection performance, due to the adoption 
of measures to fight the COVID-19 pandemic, which included, among others, the reduction in the 
number of civil servants able to exercise of police power because they fall into risk groups. As a 
result, approximately 40% of the operations planned for the year were canceled (MMA, 2021) 

Similar situation occurred in other countries of LA, where the Institutional capacity of agencies 
involved in monitoring, control, capacity building and other activities related to forest management 
were affected by the pandemic. Forestry and environmental agencies involved in monitoring and 
supporting forest-related activities were only partially operating, and restricted to office with 
reduced work hours, in response to the measures to prevent the dissemination of coronavirus 
(TOMASELLI, 2021). 

In Paraguay, compliance with legislation is a challenge that was aggravated by the reduction in the 
institutional capacity of public agencies, a situation that was intensified by the emergence of some 
conflicts (IFSA Paraguay questionnaire). 

g. International and Regional Cooperation 

Regional and international cooperation projects could be considered as important allies to contribute 
to the development of strategies to deal with the impact of the pandemic on markets and the world 
economy. Some initiatives in the environmental and forestry sector aimed at mitigating the impacts 
of the pandemic were identified in LAC.  

In Brazil, given the situation of the COVID-19 pandemic, the German Ministry for Economic 
Cooperation and Development (BMZ) carried out “Emergency Collaborative Actions” with projects 
that benefit indigenous peoples and traditional communities. These actions were carried out through 
the Deutsche Gesellschaft für Internationale Zusammenarbeit (GIZ) and in cooperation with the 
Amazon Fund/BNDES (GIZ, 2020). On November 24, 2020, another agreement was signed with the 
German federal bank Kreditanstalt für Wiederaufbau (KfW), in the amount of € 25.5 million that will 
be donated to the project “Innovation in Agricultural Production Chains for Forest Conservation in 
Legal Amazon”. The project's objective is to expand and strengthen sustainable practices in the meat, 
soy and timber production chains in states in the Legal Amazon (CANAL RURAL, 2020). 

Peru received support from the United States Agency for International Development (USAID). The 
USAID was announced a project  to provide assistance, in partnership with the Peruvian non-profit 
organization CEDRO (Centro de Educación e Información para la Prevención del Abuso de Drogas), 
Rainforest Foundation US along with Microfinanzas Prisma and other private partners, for the Social 
and Economic Recovery of the Amazon starting in May 2020. The project will involve an investment 
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of US$ 3 million. This alliance seeks to mitigate the impacts of the COVID-19 pandemic on vulnerable 
populations in Peru, particularly on indigenous communities and other areas of the Amazon. The 
Alliance also addresses economic recovery by providing business development assistance to micro, 
small and medium-sized entrepreneurs and expanding access to credit lines for business expansion. 
Also, in response to the COVID-19 pandemic, the Programa Pro-Bosques in Peru provided technical 
assistance to national and sub-national counterparts to prepare biosecurity guidelines for safe 
logging and provided guidance to beneficiaries on accessing public financing for forest sector 
activities, through Peru's economic reactivation initiative (USAID, 2021). 

The crisis of health caused by COVID-19 was the focus in 2020 of international aid that Chile received 
from other nations or world organizations, which delivered about US$ 10 million to the country to 
face the pandemic and also to implement cooperation projects. Within the total amount of aid 
received USD 4.2 million were from Germany, Japan, Adaptation Found, IDB, the World Bank, 
Switzerland and the European Union, for the implementation of initiatives in the area of the 
environment. Chile maintained a strong cooperation with Argentina, with projects developed from 
the Antofagasta Region to the Los Lagos Region, mainly in the areas of economic cooperation for 
development and the environment (EMOL, 2021).  
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3 – KEY MEASURES ADOPTED TO MITIGATE THE COVID-19 IMPACTS 

The COVID-19 pandemic broke out in the LA region on February 26, 2020, when Brazil confirmed the 
first case in São Paulo and many more cases began to appear in other countries in the following 
weeks. The first cases observed in the region in late February and early March were mainly related to 
travelers returning to or arriving from Europe, Asia and North America regions. 

In response, most countries in Latin America decided, during March, to close their borders, except for 
the return of citizens and residents. In addition, countries implemented measures to restrict the 
opening of public spaces and restrictions on social events. Some countries have applied stricter 
national measures such as curfews, targeted lockdowns and/or partial or total confinement rules. 

3.1 – Limitation of social contacts 

Social isolation was one of the main measures adopted by federal and state governments in the LA 
region to prevent the dissemination of COVID-19. However, each country and each state handled this 
measure differently. 

In Argentina, the main social isolation measures adopted were (GOBIERNO DE ARGENTINA, 2021): 

 Suspension of face-to-face classes in all schools in the country; 

 Authorization and remote work for the public and private sector; 

 Prohibition of non-resident foreigners entering the country; 

 Special provisions for public transport, such as requiring buses to only run with seated 
passengers to avoid overcrowding; 

More recently, in August 2021, the Argentine government determined new general preventive 
measures, strengthening social isolation, such as suspension of activities and gatherings in closed 
spaces, prohibition of recreational practice of any sport in closed places where more than 10 people 
participate, closed restaurants between 11 pm and 6 am, among others. 

In Brazil, Federal Law No. 13.979/2020 established measures to deal with the emergency caused by 
COVID-19. This law provides for social isolation and quarantine as a way to avoid contamination. The 
situation in Brazil was unusual, as there were contamination peaks throughout 2020 and 2021, which 
occurred differently in the states. Thus, states and municipalities established specific decrees in 
periods of high rates of contamination, death and overcrowding of intensive care unit (ICU) beds in 
public and private hospitals. Some of the main measures adopted by the states during this period 
were: 

 Closing of restaurants, shops, gyms and other services, except essential services; 

 Restriction of social events in closed spaces; 

 Curfew with restricted circulation in public spaces and streets at specific times 

 Prohibition of access to beaches and other areas; 

 Reduction in public transport capacity and others. 

Social isolation in Brazil was partial, with a national average rate of 31% throughout 2020, reaching 
50% along some periods of 2021 (VEJA, 2021). 

The Government of Chile has decided for a strategy to control COVID-19 contamination which has 
been called strategic and dynamic quarantine, in which communities alternate social 
distancing/isolation depending on the epidemiological situation of that community/location, allowing 
the movement of people only in the case of essential services. Furthermore, Chile has taken other 
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more restrictive measures, such as prohibiting the movement of people between 10 pm and 5 am, 
closing of schools throughout the country and closing all borders. On September 27, 2021, the 
Chilean government decreed the end of the state of emergency in the country at a time when the 
country has already vaccinated more than 88% of its population against the COVID-19 (GOBIERNO DE 
CHILE, 2021; G1, 2021b). 

Peru's government closed the country's borders at the beginning of the pandemic, instructed people 
to go out their homes only for essentials, such as buying food and medicine, and decreed curfews at 
different times in all cities. Failure to comply with the measures or posting false information about 
COVID-19 could lead to imprisonment.  

However, according to BBC News (2021), maintaining isolation in Peru was a challenge due to some 
specific local conditions: 

 About 71% of the workforce in Peru lives in the informal sector or works in commerce; 

 Need to go out often to supermarkets, for example, as only around 22% of poor families in 
Peru have a refrigerator, not being able to store enough food; 

 Supermarkets and banks were the main sources of contagion because they were always full; 

 Around 12% of poor families in Peru live in overcrowded housing, making it difficult to 
maintain social distance at home. 

Bolivia and Paraguay adopted similar measures of Peru (BBC News, 2021). The government of 
Uruguay did not decree mandatory quarantine; however, it closed the country´s borders and 
suspended classes at schools and universities. 

3.2 – Essential services/operation 

The establishment of essential services that could work during the emergency period was one of the 
most used strategies among LAC governments to maintain the economy working and try to control 
the COVID-19 dissemination. 

The Brazilian government defined, through Decree No. 10.282/2020, a broad list of essential services, 
including: all services related to health, public and private security, national and civil defense, 
transport, telecommunications and internet, electric energy and others. It is also noteworthy that the 
states of the federation were free to establish measures regarding the operation of essential 
services. 

It is also noteworthy that forest production aimed mainly at manufacturing pulp and paper was 
considered essential in most LA countries. 

3.3 – Health Measures 

Health care systems in most LA countries have significantly lower capacity than the OECD average, 
with lower health expenditure, fewer hospital beds and health professionals per capita, in addition to 
weak disease surveillance and tracking systems (OECD, 2020). 

Faced with these challenges, governments of the region had to implement measures to increase the 
capacity of their health care systems to deal with the crisis, together with facilitating access for all 
populations. Some of the measures included building emergency hospitals in record time (e.g., 
Argentina), providing additional ICU beds (e.g., Colombia and Peru) and training health professionals 
to work in intensive care units (e.g., Brazil and Chile). Additionally, some governments made 
arrangements with private clinics to immediately increase the number of beds available (OECD, 
2020). 
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Chile issued Decree No. 356 which determined that clinics should increase their ICU bed capacity by 
20% in one week and 100% in one month. Some countries, such as Uruguay and Argentina, have also 
developed their own test kits with state-funded research from leading national universities, together 
with technology companies (OECD, 2020). 

In Brazil government has zeroed import taxes on products for medical and hospital use. In addition, 
the Ministry of Economy, through Inter-ministerial Ordinance No. 12.683/2020, authorized the hiring 
over 5 thousand temporary professionals to strengthen the health area (GOVERNO DO BRASIL, 
2021). Some companies of the forest sector operating in Brazil also made efforts and investments in 
health measures to combat COVID-19. Bracell, Cenibra, CMPC, Duratex, Gerdau, Ibema, International 
Paper, Klabin, Suzano, Veracel and Westrock invested at least R$114 million in solidarity actions to 
purchase respirators, face masks, hand sanitizer, sanitary water, hospital gowns, gloves, in addition 
to investment and direct donation of materials in infrastructure or for the operation of 15 hospitals 
(IBÁ, 2020). 

The government of Paraguay took as an emergency measure, together with the Ministry of Health, 
the purchase of medicines and health supplies in the amount of 530 billion Guarani, within an 
established timetable. In addition, the government of Paraguay prioritized the hiring of health 
professionals, with an additional staff of approximately 2,700 people (IFSA Paraguay Questionnaire). 

Vaccination was one of the most important health measures adopted by countries in the LA region. 
are important asymmetries between developed countries and middle-income countries, There 

among those where most countries in LAC are found in the dynamics of vaccination. Vaccination 
efforts are the result of some measures adopted by countries such as national immunization plans 
and agreements with laboratories in the vaccine manufacturing for the population. Among the main 
measures of the countries, some stand out (CEPAL, 2021c): 

 In Argentina, in November 2020, the Law on Vaccines Aimed at Generating Acquired 
Immunity against COVID-19 was enacted. In December 2020 the government approved 
Strategic Vaccination Plan against COVID-19, which provided for the supply of vaccines and 
supplies needed to vaccinate the target population and transfers to the provinces through 
different programs; 

 In Bolivia, the public health measure created refers to the obligation to implement 
biosecurity measures, including the vaccination strategy (Bolivia Questionnaire, 2021).  

 In Brazil the Ministry of Health launched the National Plan for the Operationalization of 
Vaccination against Covid-19 in February, 2021. 

 In Chile the Vaccine Road began in May 2020, when the Government contacted the main and 
most promising laboratories that were studying and trying to discover a vaccine. Agreements 
and contracts have been signed with Pfizer / BioNTech, Sinovac, AstraZeneca-Oxford, 
Johnson & Johnson and Covax. Considering the great advances of the vaccination plan, which 
exceeds 11 million people with both doses’ vaccination, and more than 23 million doses 
administered. It is expected that with and gradual opening up and the relaxation of mobility 
restrictions, the processes linked to investment will accelerate, as well as continue to bolster 
economic activity (Chile Questionnaire, 2021). 

 Colombia created the national vaccination plan in February, 2021, defining the vaccination 
schedule and priority groups of the population. 

 The government of Peru established a vaccination plan in October, 2020, including a 
schedule that prioritizes high-risk individuals. 
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Vaccination has advanced well in most LA countries. On 14 October, 2021, PAHO reported that 39% 
of the LAC population has a plan of vaccination against COVID-19. However, this advance of 
vaccination has been uneven across countries. For example, Uruguay has surpassed 80% of 
vaccination, while Paraguay and Bolivia have less than 40% of the population fully vaccinated. 

The updated status of vaccination in Latin America is presented in Table 8, considering fully 
vaccinated population. 

 

Table 8 - Status of COVID-19 vaccination in some countries of Latin America (as of November/2021) 

Country Share of fully vaccinated 
population (%) 

Argentina 68.8  

Bolivia 36.9 

Brazil 65.8 

Chile 85.1 

Colombia 51.5 

Costa Rica 65.5 

Ecuador 67.1 

Paraguay 38.4 

Peru 60.2 

Uruguay 76.5 
Source: Our World in Data (2021) 

 

3.4 – Economic Relief/Stimulus Measures 

Most LA countries have adopted economic stimulus measures to help companies and individuals, 
especially those included in economically vulnerable situations, often with a focus on micro and small 
businesses. 

In Argentina the main economic policies adopted by the government stands out (OECD, 2020): 

 A credit line of € 43 million for SMEs from the Nation Bank (Banco Nación) at preferential 
rates, including € 36 million for companies producing food, medical supplies, personal 
hygiene and essential goods, for working capital and/or investments, and other € 7.2 million 
exclusively for telework; 

 Flexible fiscal measures, such as minimizing personal and corporate taxes; 

 Prices of food, personal hygiene, medicines and medical frozen products for 30 days; 

 Public banks will support private companies with working capital for up to 180 days; 

 Monetary policy easing. 

The Brazilian government also established economic measures to combat the impacts of the COVID-
19 pandemic (GOVERNO DO BRASIL, 2020). The most relevant were: 

 Measures to facilitate the renegotiation of up to USD 690 billion in debt for companies and 
families to stimulate the economy; 

 Low interest credit line for small and medium-sized companies; 
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 Government waived to collect the Tax on Financial Transactions (IOF) on credit operations 
during the crisis to stimulate economic activity; 

 USD 6.1 billion program to subsidize the salaries of people in situations of contract 
suspension / reduced hours; 

 Creation of emergency assistance in the amount of R$ 600 for low-income or unemployed 
Brazilians; 

 Provisional Measure that transfers R$ 21.5 billion from the Social Integration Program/ Civil 
Servant Patrimony Formation Program (PIS/PASEP) to Government Severance Indemnity 
Fund for Employees (FGTS) and releases a withdrawal of R$1,045 per worker. 

In Chile, several government economic measures were taken, including: 

 Launch of a US$ 12 billion emergency plan for the Emergency Family Income Project, local 
governments, civil society organizations, increased unemployment protection and health 
services (OECD, 2020); 

 The Ministry of Finance and the Internal Revenue Service, has suspended the monthly 
provisional payments (PPM) of the Income Tax of companies for three months (ILO,2020); 

 The Central Bank of Chile reduced the monetary policy interest rate by 50 basis points, to 
0.50% (ILO,2020); 

 Law No. 21.225/2020 established a capitalization of the Bank of Chile for USD 500 million, 
which will be mainly destined to grant credit line to SMEs and to the persons (ILO, 2020). 

The government of Colombia launched in July 2020 the post-COVID economic recovery plan focused 
on job creation and international e-commerce to reduce unemployment rate to 6% by the end of 
2022. It also established specific tax-free days, such as VAT to promote consumption. In addition, it 
established economic recovery measures for SMEs (OECD, 2020). 

As main economic measures, the government of Paraguay allowed the fractioning of the IRPJ in up to 
5 interest-free installments with exemption from fines. The Central Bank of Paraguay also 
determined the reduction of the monetary policy interest rate, from 4% to 3.75%. To stimulate the 
commercial sector, a reduction in the import tariff on capital goods and e-commerce facilities was 
established, with an emphasis on the services sector (IFSA Paraguay Questionnaire). 

Economic Plan to combat COVID-19, with approved measures Peruvian government implemented its 
equivalent to S/ 143 million soles. These resources are aimed at strengthening health services to 
control the impact of COVI-19, economic support for the most vulnerable families and measures to 
support small businesses (MEF PERU, 2020). 

In Uruguay, an investment stimulus plan was launched with new tax breaks for large investments. 

Also, credit lines of approximately USD 50 million were issued to companies (OECD, 2020). 

3.5 – Funding Programs 

The Pan-American Health Organization (PAHO)/WHO created the PAHO COVID-19 Response Fund, in 
which donations are requested to support individual countries and territories in LAC to combat the 
pandemic. Several governments of LA countries have also created programs aimed to allocate funds 
to combat the impacts of COVID-19 on the economy and health of the population. Among the funds 
identified in the LA region, include: 

In Brazil, the government allocated USD 100 billion in 2020 and R$ 97.2 billion in 2021 for measures 
to fight the pandemic. Most of this resource was aimed at the Emergency Assistance Program for 
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people in vulnerable situations, which totaled USD 70 billion in 2020 and 2021 (GOVERNO DO BRASIL, 
2021b). 

In Peru, the Ministry of Economy and Finance expanded the coverage of the “Crescer Fund” credit by 
up to 90% for micro, small and medium-sized enterprises to reducing the economic impact of the 
COVID-19 (GOBIERNO DE PERÚ, 2020), and the government of Chile destined USD 12 billion as an 
emergency fund for the Emergency Family Income Project (OECD, 2020).  

In Colombia, the Government increased the capital of the National Guarantee Fund with 70 billion 
Colombian Peso in loans for different sectors of the economy and protection of employment 
(PARLAMENTO ANDINO, 2021).  

The Banco Nacional de Fomento (BNF) of Paraguay made available a special line of working capital 
for the production sector. Additionally, FONPLATA (Development Bank) granted the BNF a revolving 
credit line of USD 36 million, with a term of 8 years, whose resources can be applied to the financing 
of small and medium-sized companies that are part of the export-related value chains. 

In Peru, the National Forest and Wildlife Service (SERFOR) of the Ministry of Agrarian Development 
and Irrigation, in coordination with different regional authorities in Cajamarca, Loreto, Ucayali and 
San Martín, has been working on a proposal for the preparation of a financing program to facilitate 
access of small non-timber forest producers under the AGROPERÚ Fund. This program seeks to 
promote the competitiveness of economic activities based on sustainable use of biodiversity (ADEX 
Peru questionnaire). 

respond to the impacts caused by COVID-19, through new The World Bank has also supported LAC to 
operations and redirection of resources of existing projects (WORLD BANK, 2021b). The World Bank 
approved a USD 500 million loan for Argentina to strengthen the battle against COVID-19, through 
the purchase of vaccines for more than 30% of the population, as well as activities to support 
implementation of the national vaccination plan. In Uruguay, the World Bank approved a USD 20 
million emergency loan to support the Uruguayan government's efforts to minimize the impact of 
the COVID-19 pandemic on the health system. 

3.6 – Investment and Financing Measures 

Some governments have created measures to boost the national economy and these initiatives 
include lines of credit and financing, mainly for small and medium-sized companies. 

In Chile, measures related to financing and investments in the forestry sector include:  

 FOGAPE-COVID - It strongly expands the small enterprise guarantee fund, increasing state 
guarantees by up to USD 3 billion, allowing companies to finance up to 1 million UF in annual 
sales (previously only up to 350 thousand UF). Over 283 thousand credits were issued, of 
which 97% were destined to small and medium-sized companies; 

 Support through productive development programs, such as Solidarity and Social Investment 
Fund (FOSIS), Institute for Agricultural Development (INDAP) and Chilean Economic. 
Development Agency (CORFO); 

 New administrative services for entrepreneurship and recapitalization of SMEs. 

According to the Ministry of Finance of Chile, the balance of loans with FOGAPE's guarantee, as of 
June/ 2021, the different financial institutions have granted over 113 thousand loans, of which 97% 
have been to SMEs (Chile Questionnaire). In addition, through Law 21.288 COVID-19 Transitory 
Emergency Fund, the federal government of Chile has allocated significant resources to reactivate 
the economy. In the case of the forestry sector, three measures were considered (Chile 
Questionnaire, 2021): 
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 Establishment of forest fire brigades: To date, 87 out of 89 brigade bases have been tendered 
and their work has begun. The remaining two are in the bidding process; 

 Park Guard building project at the Torres del Paine National Park, which will improve the 
living conditions of the park rangers who work in the most isolated areas, and will increase 
security for more than 80 thousand people who visit the park all seasons; 

 Economic Reactivation Program for small and medium-sized forest owners, including forest 
management, afforestation or recovering an area of 24 thousand hectares in two seasons 
2021 (19,304 ha) and 2022 (4,826 ha), in both private and public forests, from the Coquimbo 
region to Magallanes to promote economic reactivation and job creation in the rural areas. 

In relation to financing and credit, in some countries specific lines for financing aimed at the forest-
based sector, as well as small producers and family farmers, have been identified. 

In Brazil, the Amazon Plan, an initiative of three private banks (Itaú, Bradesco and Santander) has the 
objective of leveraging sustainable development in the region. In addition, the Brazilian Forest 
Service (SFB) decreed the postponement of the payment due date of the installments related to 
forest production of the first two quarters of 2020 to December in forest concession contracts. 
Argentina created the Forest Sustainability and Competitiveness Program IDB 2863 / OC-AR, and 
Peru has established a Direct Financing Program for Forest Plantations as well as a program for the 
forest out grower scheme and Sustainable Management of Forest Production with about 513 million 
soles in nine regions.  

In Bolivia, no specific measure to financing and investments for the forest sector were identified. 
However, in terms of production, the government made available a credit line to companies. But that 
have not been very effective due to the excessive bureaucracy for its access (Bolivia Questionnaire, 
2021). 

Other national initiatives were identified in Paraguay and Mexico. In Paraguay, a credit incentive for 
sustainable forest production in the country through the National Development Bank (BNF) and the 
Financial Development Agency (AFD) was developed and in Mexico the incentive was created 
through the National Financing for Agricultural, Rural, Forest and Fisheries Development 2020-2024. 

3.7 – Social and Employment-related Measures 

The governments of LA countries have established social measures related to the maintenance of 
employment and income, especially for people in a socially vulnerable situation. These measures 
include expanding existing programs or creating new ones to reach the population not covered by 
existing programs. 

In Argentina, the Emergency Assistance Program for Work and Production (ATP) was created by 
Decree 332/2020 (BO 04/01/2020) to provide immediate economic relief to those companies and 
workers directly affected by the fall in the economic activity after the contingency measures 
implemented during the Health Emergency. The Program consists of (GOBIERNO DE ARGENTINA, 
2021): 

 Postponement or reduction of up to 95% of the payment of employer contributions to the 
Argentine Integrated Social Security System; 

 Complementary salary paid by the federal government for male and female workers 
dependent on the private sector; 

 Zero Rate loans for people abide by the Monotax (monotributo) for independent workers 
(monotax borrowers), a comprehensive unemployment benefit system. 
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In Bolivia, the government established the labor order measure related to employment tenure, that 
is, the workers covered by the employment tenure (job immobility) during the pandemic may not be 
dismissed, impaired or transferred without just cause. No specific measure related to forest-
dependent people has been established (Bolivia Questionnaire, 2021).  

In Brazil, the government adopted measures to support people in vulnerable situation, workers and 
employers (GOVERNO DO BRASIL, 2021), including: 

 “Bolsa Família” is a program aimed at family household units in poverty and extreme 
poverty, financial aid changes from R$ 89 to R$178 per month during the pandemic; 

 Payment of Emergency Assistance of R$ 600 per month to people in vulnerable 
situations; 

 Prohibition of electricity cuts due to payment default by residential consumers and 
providers of essential activities between March 25, 2020 and 31 July,2020; 

 Emergency Program for Maintenance of Employment and Income, where employers can 
make individual or collective agreements with their employees, lasting up to 120 days 
and reduce working hours and wages or suspend employment contract. 

The government of Chile has created the following social related measures: 

 The Employment Protection Law for COVID-19 (Law 21.288/2020), which establishes that 
workers with a contract affiliated with unemployment insurance who comply with the 
conditions established by the law can have an indefinite contract, a fixed term or by work or 
task. It also applies to domestic workers. The rules do not apply to women using maternity 
leave of absence (BCN, 2021); 

 The Emergency Family Income (IFE), an economic aid for households that received 
insufficient informal and formal income and these resources diminished because they could 
not work due to COVID-19. The amount of the benefit depends on the number of people in 
the household and the socioeconomic situation of the family in the state of emergency; 

 COVID-19 Emergency Bonus, a special bonus that is part of the Government's Economic 
Emergency Plan, which aims to support the most vulnerable families in the health 
contingency due to Covid-19; 

 Special benefit for independent workers aimed at workers who faced a decrease of at least 
30% of their income from salary compared to the average income in the last 12 months. If 
the taxpayer registered an average monthly income, between April 2019 and March 2020, 
equal to or less than $ 320,500 Chilean Peso, the benefit could reach up to 70% of the 
amount of the monthly drop in their income. If the average monthly income was higher than 
$ 320,500, the benefit was calculated proportionally to the decrease in income (GOBIERNO 
DE CHILE, 2021). 

In Peru, the following social related measures were identified (PARLAMENTO ANDINO, 2021b): 

 Creation of temporary jobs through the transfer of S/ 150 million Peruvian Soles; Agroperú 
Fund with S/ 440 million soles to directly finance small agricultural producers; and Agrobanco 
with S/ 100 million soles to finance credit at low interest rates; 

 Operation of the Peru Jobs platform, through which citizens can access different job offers in 
the pandemic period; 

 Allocation of a bonus corresponding to S/ 380 soles for households living in poverty or 

extreme poverty; 
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 Bonus of S/760 soles to benefit more than one million households that are part of the rural 
sector. 

In Uruguay, the main measures were (GOBIERNO DE URUGUAY, 2021b): 

 Payment of the subsidy of 1.5 Base of Benefits and Contributions (BPC) per month, during a 
quarter, to 19,000 workers in the sectors most affected by the pandemic; 

 Special subsidy for partial unemployment until June 30, 2021; 

 Flexibility in the use of unemployment insurance and right to use it for a shorter time and 

even part-time, to contemplate the sectors affected by the partial stoppage of their 
activities. 

In Paraguay, the Ministry of Labor, Employment and Social Security promoted four (4) Policies 
(MTESS, 2021):  

  Sustaining Employment: Protection Plan for Formal Workers; compensation for suspension 
of employment contracts, compensation for vulnerability and others. 

  Reactivation of Employment: job intermediation and guidance services; Paraguay Poguapy 
Plan, which benefited 131 MSMEs with training, technical assistance and capital goods. 

  Formalization and Social Security: Promotion of the Regulation and Legislation of 
teleworking, the Unemployment Insurance Law, the Regulation of the Suspension of 
Employment Contracts, the Emergency Law and its regulations, and the Law of extension of 
the validity of the Emergency Law 

  Occupational Health and Safety: design and application of occupational health and safety 
protocols to maintain healthy work environments to prevent the spread of COVID-19. 
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4 – IMPACTS OF THE MEASURES ADOPTED AND RECOVERY 

4.1 – General Assessment 

Despite the immeasurable impact of the pandemic on the economy and on people's lives, a recovery 
is expected for 2021 and 2022. This economic recovery may occur differently among countries and 
economic sectors, as a result of economic measures and fiscal stimulus implemented by some 
governments. 

The World Bank perspectives (2021) estimate that LA should have a growth of 5.2% in 2021, 
considering the advance of the vaccination schedule in most countries, the relaxation of mobility 
restrictions, the positive effects of advanced economies and the rise in commodity prices. 

Also, according to the World Bank (2021), the following perspectives stand out (World Bank, 2021): 

 Brazil's economy is expected to grow 4.5% in 2021, supported by a new round of emergency 
payments to families and by good domestic and international credit conditions; 

 Mexico's economy is expected to grow 5% in 2021 as the manufacturing and services sectors 
will be benefited from the growing export demand associated with strong USA growth; 

 Growth in Argentina is expected to recover 6.4% in 2021. 

 Colombia's economy is expected to expand by 5.9% in 2021, 

 Chile's and Peru's are expected to grow by 6.1% and 10.3%, respectively. 

The dynamics of economic growth from 2021 onwards are subject to uncertainties resulting from the 
uneven progress in vaccination processes and the ability of countries to reverse the structural 
problems behind the low-growth course they showed prior to the pandemic. 

For the International Monetary Fund, the three key issues and how these issues will be addressed 
starting in 2021 will have an impact on economic growth. First, it is important to know how short-
term restrictions will affect resumption before vaccines begin to provide effective protection to the 
entire society. Furthermore, how public policies and vaccination campaigns can boost economic 
activity. Finally, how financial conditions and raw material prices will evolve. The latter will be critical 
for South American countries whose economies depend to a great extent on exports (El País, 2021). 

Employment rates in some Latin American and Caribbean countries experienced a relative recovery 
in 2021, although for the most part they are well below pre-pandemic levels. The quality of available 
jobs has also declined, as well as the number of hours of paid work per week. For the LAC region, in 
2021, the employment rate stood at around 62%, almost 11 percentage points below the pre-
pandemic level. In addition, formal employment dropped 5.3% in the region, while self-employment 
grew 5.7%, and the proportion of workers in small companies increased 8% (ISTOÉ, 2021) 

Along with the prospects for economic improvement, a great advance is already recognized in terms 
the number of new cases and deaths from COVID-19 in the region. Table 9 shows a of a reduction in 

summary on the reduction in the number of daily deaths from COVID-19 in selected LAC. 
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Table 9 – Comparative number of daily deaths from COVID-19 in selected countries in Latin America  

Country Dec/2020 Dec/2021 

Argentina 163 31 

Brazil 964 301 

Chile 18 4 

Colombia 161 51 

Peru 120 54 
Source: Our Word in Data (2021). 

When comparing daily deaths in December 2021 and in the same period in 2020, the reduction in all 
analyzed countries is remarkable. This reduction reflects the advance and effectiveness of 
vaccination and containment measures used.  

Regarding the labor market, ILO (2021) estimates that the recovery of the LA economy is still 
insufficient to recover the jobs lost during the COVID-19 pandemic. This situation resulted in a labor 
market characterized by a high unemployment rate and a strong predominance of informal jobs. 
About 70% of the jobs generated from mid-2020 to the first quarter of 2021 are informal jobs. In the 
first quarter of 2021, about 76% were considered self-employed/ independent workers and just over 
a third was informal workers. 

4.2 – Forest Sector 

Few government measures were taken to reduce the impact of the COVID-19 pandemic on the forest 
sector and forest industry. The main measure adopted by some countries was the inclusion of forest 
production activities as an essential service during the pandemic, which may have positively 
impacted the production and trade of forest products. In Brazil, the forest sector was able to operate 
normally in most states, while other countries, such as Colombia, Ecuador, Paraguay and Peru had 
restrictions on forest activities. 

As for more specific measures related to the forest sector, the Brazilian Forest Service postponed the 
payments of the installments of forest production that the concessionaires pay quarterly to the 
government, seeking to guarantee the maintenance of jobs and financial health of companies. 

The Peruvian government implemented an economic stimulus package called the “Reactiva” 1 and 2 
Program to boost the private sector recovery during the COVID-19 crises. This stimulus guarantees 
the lowest interest rate (1.1 % for loans under the Program) offered to companies. In Bolivia, no 
specific measure related to Sustainable Forest Management or industrial production or market / 
trade of forest sector was created to mitigate the impact of the pandemic (Bolivia Questionnaire, 
2021). 

Also in Chile, the Economic Reactivation Program for small and medium-sized forest owners, 
including forest management, afforestation or recovering an area of 24 thousand hectares, involving 
private and public forests, bolster the local economy. This is promoting economic reactivation and 
job creation in the rural areas. Among the expected results, it is indicated that this project will 
improve the direct income condition of more than 2 thousand families and the generation of around 
31 thousand direct jobs. This will directly contribute to the restoration of the economic income of 
this target group and the revitalization of local economies. To date, activities in 15 thousand hectares 
have been carried out on 814 properties (Chile Questionnaire, 2021). 

In terms of economic recovery, the outlook for the forest sector is generally optimistic, partly 
because of the resumption of civil construction in the US, the main destination market for solid wood 
products of LA countries. Production and export levels have returned, or will most possibly return to 
pre-pandemic levels, for most countries of the region along the next months. 
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The population's consumption patterns have changed. They started to consume more hygiene and 
cleaning materials, whose raw material comes, in large part, from pulp. In addition, with the fact that 
restaurants and shops have closed temporarily, the population started to use more food delivery 
services and on line acquisition of goods, increasing the demand for paper packaging.  

Additionally the work format also has changed, with many companies migrating to the home office 
modality, thus, people started to invest to reform houses and to acquire modern and comfortable 
wooden furniture, increasing the demand of forest products such timber, veneer, plywood and other 
wood-based panels. 

This is a trend that will possibly continue in the future. In Brazil, for example, the production and 
apparent consumption of pulp, paper and wood base panels are already higher than were in 2020 
and 2019, as shown in Table 10 (IBÁ, 2021). 

 

Table 10 - Production and apparent consumption of pulp, paper and wood-based panels in Brazil (2019-2021) 

Product Item Unit 2019 2020 
Variation  
(19-20) 

2021* 
Variation  
 (20-21) 

Pulp 
Production 1,000 ton 19,691 20,953 6% 22,340 7% 

Consumption 1,000 ton 5,218 5,510 6% 7,172 30% 

Paper 
Production 1,000 ton 10,535 10,184 -3% 10,625 4% 

Consumption 1,000 ton 5,458 5,236 -4% 5,512 5% 

Wood-based 
panels 

Consumption 1,000 m³ 6,695 7,138 7% 8,197 15% 

*Estimated data for 2021, based on preliminary results. 

Source: IBÁ (2021). 

The Argentina forest sector has shown a recovery in 2021, considering that total exports in the first 
semester of 2021 totaled 376 million dollars and increased 28.3% compared to the same period of 
the previous year (INDEC, 2021). 

In Chile, the trend is similar, wood exports totaled US$ 581 million in July 2021, a 34% increase over 
the same month in 2020, with a cumulative total of around US$ 3.2 billion in the first seven months 
of the year, representing an 13% increase over the same period in 2020 (CORMA, 2021). 

In Peru, in the third quarter of 2021, wood exports totaled US$ 86 million, 34.5% more than in the 
same period in 2020. The largest shipments were molded wood (US$ 22 million, + 140.6 %), slats and 
non-assembled parquet floorings (US$12 million, +4.2%) and other tropical woods (US$12 million, 
+32.8%). The recovery of wood shipments in the first 10 months of 2021 compared to 2019 was 
promoted by France and USA, which increased their demand by 175.3% and 60.6%, respectively. The 
high percentages are due to a statistical effect in view of the situation caused by the pandemic in 
2020. National wood consumption increased, due to restrictions and remote working. Many had to 
buy furniture, desks, chairs and other products. This trend was worldwide, so prices increased, 
reducing the availability of wood. Added to this was the decrease in wood from Chile (Pinus Radiata), 
since prices have favored selling its wood to other markets (ADEX Peru questionnaire).  

economy of LA It is also noteworthy that tourism and ecotourism have a strong participation in the 
countries, especially Argentina, Brazil, Peru and Chile. Considering the advanced vaccination phases 
in these countries and the recovery of the economy, it is very likely that people will start to travel 
more and tourism and ecotourism activities will be boosted by this recovery. 
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5 – BEST PRACTICES IDENTIFIED 

All countries have implemented financial support measures to uphold businesses and individuals, 
most often with a special focus on the vulnerable population. It is still too early to say which of these 
practices were in fact effective in reducing the impact of COVID-19 on the economy, and were 
sufficient to mitigate the social impact. Some of the best practices identified are highlighted below. 

 Health measures 

The health measures adopted by countries of the region were essential to combat COVID-19, 
save lives and re-establish public health. Despite being a challenge in many countries with 
very specific local conditions, social isolation is the main sanitary measure to control COVID-
19, together with the use of face masks and hand hygiene helped to reduce the 
dissemination of the pandemic.   

In general, countries of the LA region significantly increased capacity of hospitals to treat 
infected people, and specially the availability of ICU beds. Measures related to vaccination 
were put in place, such as national immunization plans and agreements with laboratories 
involve the production of vaccines for the population. 

 Economic measures  

Development of emergency credit lines, especially for Small and Medium-sized companies in 
the production sector and rural producers, were made available in most countries of the 
region.  Other initiatives such as fiscal measures, tax reduction or exemption were also 
implemented by a majority of the countries, and help to mitigate the economic impact of the 
pandemic. 

Measures to facilitate access to credit and debt renegotiation, involving small, medium and 
even larger companies, were also important to maintain operations and employment. 
Emergency aid in the form of direct transfer to the population, especially low income and 
poor family, created a condition to boost consumption and reactivate the economy. 

 Social measures 

Most countries of the region created programs to ensure the maintenance of employment 
and income, involving among other the direct transfer of financial resources to support 
vulnerable population. Other social measures involved the non-suspension of electricity 
supply and other services due to non-payment. 

In some countries companies were encouraged to retain workers, based on a more flexible 
working legislation, including individual or collective agreements between employers and 
employees, and creation of temporary jobs regulation, with government subsidy. This 
avoided dismissals of employees and closing companies. Programs also included a temporary 
unemployment benefit and adjustment of labor laws to facilitate the use of unemployment 
insurance. 

 Specific measures for the forestry sector 

The forest sector as a whole was in general benefited from the general measures put in place 
by governments of the region to mitigate the social and economic impact of the pandemic. 

In any case, the forest sector benefited, in most countries, from the fact that it was 
considered as an essential activity. This was extremely important to mitigate the impact of 
the COVID-19 pandemic in the forest and forest industry operations. 
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Other initiatives supported the forest sector, such as postponement of the payment of 
installments of forest production in forest concessions areas, and economic stimulus package 
to boost the recovery of forest-based companies. Nevertheless, only a few countries of the 
region have adopted the initiatives to support specifically the forest sector.  
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6 – PREPARING FOR THE FUTURE POST-COVID 

The COVID-19 pandemic has been lasting for nearly two years and continues to create significant 
challenges for society and several business segments. Since the beginning, the forest sector has 
quickly adapted their operation and behavior to meet health and safety requirements. 

The forest-based sector proved to be an important segment to face the challenges imposed by the 
COVID-19 pandemic. It supplies several products, such as pulp, which is the basis for the manufacture 
of hygiene and health materials and packaging paper. In addition, wood products have been used to 
supply people’s house, who have adapted to a new modality of work from home environment. 

In the short to medium-term this trend is expected to continue and become a new pattern. This is a 
leverage opportunity for the forest sector, with the growing demand for wood and pulp products, 
with the resumption of the Chinese market and the civil construction industry in the United States, 
major consumers of forest products from LA countries. 

The pandemic could become an opportunity for countries to become greener and more inclusive 
societies and economies. The forest sector has great potential for this, as it can effectively help 
reduce poverty, generating employment and income, showing its resilience to structural changes. 

However, to be included in these opportunities, the sector needs to face some challenges, such as 
deforestation and competition with illegal logging, forest fires, lack of inspection and compliance 
with environmental laws, in addition to changes in supply and demand in the market. 

It is essential to integrate small farmers, traditional communities and small and medium-sized forest 
companies in sustainable supply chains, including the value chains of timber and non-timber forest 
products in recovery measures and strategies. It is also essential to include REDD+ mechanisms, 
payments for environmental services and the carbon market in this green recovery, in order to value 
not only forest products, but also environmental services. 

In this context, it is important to create and implement policies, programs, strategies and 
partnerships for national and international cooperation, aimed mainly at:  

 Monitoring and inspection of forests to prevent deforestation and forest fires; 

 Implementing incentive mechanisms to encourage sustainable production, whether from 
natural or forest plantations; 

 Proposing creation of credit lines with low interest rates, specific for forest production of 
wood and non-wood products; 

 Promoting trade and consumption of sustainable and legal forest products, supporting 
national production. 
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